Harpana Gouernment Guazette

EXTRAORDINARY
Published by Authority

© Govt. of Haryana

30-2020/Ext.] CHANDIGARH, WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 26, 2020 (PHALGUNA 7, 1941 SAKA)

HARYANA VIDHAN SABHA SECRETARIAT
Notification
The 26th February, 2020
No. 08-HLA of 2020/19/3622.— The Haryana Panchayati Raj (Amendment) Bill, 2020, is

hereby published for general information under proviso to Rule 128 of the Rules of Procedure and
Conduct of Business in the Haryana Legislative Assembly :-

Bill No. 08- HLA of 2020

THE HARYANA PANCHAYATI RAJ (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2020
A
BiLL
further to amend the Haryana Panchayati Raj Act, 1994.

Be it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Haryana in the Seventy-first Year of the
Republic of India as follows :-

1. This Act may be called the Haryana Panchayati Raj (Amendent) Act, 2020. Short title.
2. In section 2 of the Haryana Panchayati Raj Act, 1994 (hereinafter called the principal Act),- Amendment of
.. . . Section 2 of
(@)  for clause (ii), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:- Haryana Act 11

‘(i)  “Adult” means a person, male or female or transgender, who has attained the ~©°f 1994.
age of eighteen years;’;

(b)  after clause (Ixx), the following clause shall be inserted namely:-

(Ixx-a) “Ward Sabha” means a body consisting of persons registered in the voters list
of each constituency of each Gram Panchayat.”.

3. For sub-section (1) of section 3 of the principal Act, the following sub-section shall be Amendment of
substituted, namely:- section 3 of
Haryana Act 11

“(1) Every Gram Panchayat, Panchayat Samiti and Zila Parishad unless sooner dissolved  of 1994.
under any law for the time being in force, shall continue for a period of five years from
the date of notification issued by the State Election Commission in which elected
representative are notified.”.

(259)



260 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ., (EXTRA.), FEB. 26, 2020 (PHGN. 7, 1941 SAKA)

|nse_rti0r;£f_ 4, After section 3 of the principal Act, the following section shall be inserted, namely:-

section n .

Haryana Act 11 “3A. Ward Sabha.- (1) Subject to the general orders of the Government, every Ward
of 1994, Sabha shall meet at least once in six months.

(2)  The quorum for the meeting of a Ward Sabha shall be not less than one-tenth of the
total number of members of the Ward Sabha or twenty members, whichever is less.

(3) The Ward Sabha shall, exercise the following powers and discharge the following
functions in such manner, as may be prescribed, namely:-

(@)  generate proposals and determine the priority of schemes and development
programme to be implemented in the area of the Ward Sabha and forward the
same to the Gram Sabha for inclusion in Gram Panchayat development plan;

(b) identify the most eligible persons from the area of Ward Sabha for beneficiary
oriented schemes on the basis of criteria fixed and prepare list of eligible
beneficiaries in the order of priority and forward the same to the Gram
Panchayat;

(c)  verify the eligibility of persons getting various kinds of welfare assistance from
Government such as pensions and subsidies;

(d)  get the information from the officers of the Gram Panchayat as to the services
they shall render and the works they propose to do in the succeeding period of
six months after the meeting of the Ward Sabha;

(e) get information from the Gram Panchayat on the rational of every decision of
the Gram Panchayat concerning the area of the Ward Sabha;

(f get information from the Gram Panchayat on the follow up action taken on the
decisions of the Ward Sabha;

(g)  provide and mobilize voluntary labour and contributions in cash and kind for
development work and supervise such development works through volunteer
teams;

(h)  make efforts to ensure that the members of Ward Sabha pay taxes and repay
loans to the Gram Panchayat;

(i suggest the location of streetlights, street or community water taps, public wells,
public sanitation units, irrigation facilities and such other public amenity
schemes within the area of the Ward Sabha;

) identify the deficiencies in the water supply and street lighting arrangements in
the area of Ward Sabha and suggest remedial measures;

(k) impart awareness on matters of public interest such as cleanliness, preservation
of the environment and prevention of pollution;

] assist the employees of the Gram Panchayat in sanitation arrangements in the
area of Ward Sabha and render voluntary service in the removal of garbage;

(m)  promote programme of adult education within the area of Ward Sabha;

(n)  assist the activities of public health centers in the area of the Ward Sabha
especially in disease prevention and family welfare and to prevent incidence of
epidemics and natural calamities;

(o)  promote harmony and unity among various groups of people in the area of the
Ward Sabha and to arrange cultural festivals and sports meets to give expression
to the talents of the people of the locality; and

(p)  exercise such other powers and discharge such other functions, as may be
prescribed.

(4)  The procedure for convening and conducting the meetings of the Ward Sabha shall be
such, as may be prescribed.

(5)  Every meeting of a Ward Sabha shall be presided over by the member of the Gram
Panchayat elected from the area of the concerned Ward Sabha and in his absence, by
any other member of the Gram Panchayat to be nominated by the Sarpanch.

(6)  Allresolutions in respect of any issue in the meeting of the Ward Sabha shall be passed
by a majority of the members present and voting.”.



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ., (EXTRA.), FEB. 26, 2020 (PHGN. 7, 1941 SAKA)

261

5. In

section 11 of the principal Act,-

(i) after sub-section (7), the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely:-
“(7A) For any general meeting of the Gram Sabha, one-tenth of the members
of Gram Sabha or three hundred members, whichever is less, shall form a quorum.”;
(i) insub-section (8), in the end, the words and signs shall be added, namely:-

“In case such functionary does not attend the meeting, without reasonable cause
the Gram Sachiv shall report his absence to the Government.”.

6. For section 17 of the principal Act, the following section shall be substituted, namely:-

7. In
(1)
(ii

8. In
words “fi

9. In
(M)

(ii

10.
‘62
who diso

“17. Modification or cancellation of resolution.- (1) A Gram Panchayat may
modify, amend, vary or cancel its resolution within a period of three months from the date
of its passing:

Provided that such resolution for modifying, amending, varying or cancelling
thereof shall be supported by three-fourth of the total number of panches of such Gram
Panchayat.

(2)  Incase aresolution is required to be passed by a Gram Panchayat for sale, lease or
exchange of its land, in which approval of the Government is required, the proposal shall
be placed before Gram Sabha for its suggestion and approval before a resolution is passed
by the Gram Panchayat and is forwarded to the Government for approval.

(3) No resolution of a Gram Panchayat shall be modified, amended, varied or cancelled
by a Gram Panchayat after the expiry of a period of three months, except with the prior
approval of Government.

(4) The Gram Panchayat shall act upon its resolution within a period of three months

from the date of passing of the resolution or approval by the competent authority, if
required.”.

sub-section (1) of section 20 of the principal Act,-

for the sign “.
) the following proviso shall be added, namely:-

existing at the end, the sign “:”” shall be substituted; and

“Provided that the Gram Panchayat shall prepare a report of the work not done,
during the previous year and also record the reasons.”.

sub-section (4) of section 24 of the principal Act, for the words “one thousand rupees”, the
ve thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

section 25 of the principal Act,-
for clause (s), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:-
“(S)

)  after clause (s), the following clause shall be added, namely:-

regulate and prohibit burning of residuals of crops;”;

“(u) specify the manner and the measures to regulate water conservation in the
village;

(v)  regulate the management of stray cattle;

(w)  prohibit open defecation in village.”.

For section 27 of the principal Act, the following section shall be substituted, namely:-

7. Penalty for disobedience of a special or general order of Gram Panchayat.- Any person
beys an order passed under sections 24 or 25 by the Gram Panchayat, shall be liable to a

penalty of minimum one hundred rupees which may extend to maximum two thousand rupees and if
the breach is continuous with a further penalty which may extend to one hundred rupees for everyday
after the first breach during which the breach continues:

Pr
Pr

ovided that the penalty for recurring breach shall not exceed the sum of ten thousand rupees:
ovided further that if the amount of penalty is not deposited within a period of thirty days,

it shall be recovered as arrear of land revenue within six months.”.

Amendment of
section 11 of
Haryana Act 11
of 1994.

Substitution of
section 17 of
Haryana Act 11
of 1994,

Amendment of
section 20 of
Haryana Act 11
of 1994,

Amendment of
section 24 of
Haryana Act 11
of 1994,

Amendment of
section 25 of
Haryana Act 11
of 1994.

Substitution of
section 27 of
Haryana Act 11
of 1994.



of 1994.

262 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ., (EXTRA.), FEB. 26, 2020 (PHGN. 7, 1941 SAKA)

Amendmentof 11, In section 28 of the principal Act, for the word “Director”, the words “concerned Deputy

section 28 of Commissioner” shall be substituted.

Haryana Act 11

of 1994.

Amendmentof 12 |n sub-section (3) of section 35 of the principal Act, for the words “fifty rupees™, the words

section 35 of “five hundred rupees” shall be substituted.

Haryana Act 11

of 1994.

Ale?ndTgmef 13.  Insub-section (2) of section 43 of the principal Act, for the words “as may be prescribed”, the

section 0 « 2 :

Haryana Act 11 words “of fifty rupees” shall be substituted.

of 1994.

Amendment of 14.  Insub-section (1) of section 54 of the principal Act, for the words “five hundred rupees”, the

section 54 of words “one thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

Haryana Act 11

of 1994.

Amendment of 15.  Insub-section (4) of section 125 of the principal Act, for the words “five hundred rupees”, the

section 125 of words “five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

Haryana Act 11

of 1994.

Amendment of 16.  In clause (b) of section 171 of the principal Act, for the words “one thousand rupees”, the

section 171 of words “five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

Haryana Act 11

of 1994.

Amendment of 17.  Insub-section (1) of section 172 of the principal Act, for the words “five hundred rupees”, the

section 172 of words “five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

Haryana Act 11

of 1994.

Amendment of 18.  After sub-section (5) of section 176 of the principal Act, the following sub-section shall be

section 176 of added, namely:-

Haryana Act 11 ! ’ ] o )

of 1994, “(6) Any person, aggrieved by an order passed by the civil court under sub-section (4),
may within a period of thirty days from the date of such order, prefer an appeal to the District
Judge having ordinary jurisdiction in the area. The District Judge may after hearing the appeal,
confirm, vary or reverse the order. The decision of the District Judge shall be final.”.

Amendment of 19.  In sub-section (2) of section 180 of the principal Act, for the words “one thousand rupees”,

section 180 of the words “five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

Haryana Act 11

of 1994.

Amendment of 20.  In sub-section (2) of section 181 of the principal Act, for the words “one thousand rupees”,

section 181 of the words “five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

Haryana Act 11

of 1994.

Amendment of 21.  In sub-section (3) of section 182 of the principal Act, for the words “one thousand rupees”,

section 182 of the words “five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

Haryana Act 11

of 1994.

Amendment of 22.  Insub-section (2) of section 183 of the principal Act, for the words “five hundred rupees”, the

section 183 of words “five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

Haryana Act 11

of 1994.

Amendment of 23.  In sub-section (3) of section 184 of the principal Act, for the words “one thousand rupees”,

section 184 of the words “five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

Haryana Act 11

of 1994.

Amendmentof 24, |n sub-section (1) of section 185 of the principal Act, for the words “two thousand rupees”,

section 185 of the words “five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

Haryana Act 11

of 1994.

Amendment of 25.  Insub-section (1) of section 186 of the principal Act, for the words “five hundred rupees”, the

section 186 of words “five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

Haryana Act 11



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ., (EXTRA.), FEB. 26, 2020 (PHGN. 7, 1941 SAKA)

263

26.  Insub-section (2) of section 187 of the principal Act,-

() in clause (a), for the words “rupees one thousand”, the words “ten thousand rupees”
shall be substituted;

(if)  in clause (b), for the words “five hundred rupees”, the words “five thousand rupees”
shall be substituted.

27.  In section 243 of the principal Act, for the words “one thousand rupees”, the words “five
thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

Amendment of
section 187 of
Haryana Act 11
of 1994.

Amendment of
section 243 of
Haryana Act 11
of 1994,



264

HARYANA GOVT. GAZ., (EXTRA.), FEB. 26, 2020 (PHGN. 7, 1941 SAKA)

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

To prepare Gram Panchayat Development Plan, meetings of Ward Sabha and Gram Sabha are required to be
convened; therefore, the quorum, manner and procedure to convene their meetings are necessary to be laid.

It was considered necessary to fix the date of commencement of the term of five years of the Panchayati Raj
Institutions from the date of notification issued by the State Election Commission instead of their first meeting.

It was considered necessary to ensure that Gram Panchayats do not withdraw/cancel their resolutions after a
period of three months of passing of the resolution so as to ensure certainty and finality of decision making in
the Gram Panchayats. It is also required to ascertain that Gram Panchayats are acting upon their resolutions in a
time bound manner.

To bring in more transparency and participation of the people in decision making, proposal for sale, lease or
exchange of land is required to be placed before Gram Sabha for its approval before seeking approval of the
Government.

Besides the various activities being regulated by the Gram Panchayats, some other activities i.e. stray cattle,
open defecation free, burning of residuals of crops and water conservation are also required to be regulated and
managed by the Gram Panchayats. Further, it was considered necessary that remedy of appeal against the order
of Gram Panchayat may be made available with the authority at district headquarter instead of State Headquarter.

It was considered necessary to increase the amount of penalty in case of violation of various provisions of the
Act to make it serve as an effective deterrent.

Section 176 of the Haryana Panchayati Raj Act, 1994 does not currently provide that the order passed by the
civil court in an election petition shall be the final order. Nor does it have any provision of appeal against the
order passed by the civil court. Therefore, it is necessary to make a provision of appeal against the order passed
by the civil court in an election petition.

Hence, this Bill.

DUSHYANT CHAUTALA,
Deputy Chief Minister,
Haryana.

Chandiarh: R. K. NANDAL,
The 26th February, 2020. Secretary.



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ., (EXTRA.), FEB. 26, 2020 (PHGN. 7, 1941 SAKA) 265

[FTEIET STFaTT |
2020 &7 f3S® H@&AT 8—TTOTOT0
BRI geraeht e (Gee) R, 2020
FRATOMT daRRh 11 ffeaH, 1994
B I AT B B> forg
e

YRd TORSY & ShecRd a9 d sRIm Iy fagryvsa grr fF=faRag w9 &
Ig fafrafa e —

1. Ig s sRamon tarrdY I (FeeE) rfAfRE, 2020, BT ST HhdT B | ey 1 |

2. eRaon derch I oM, 1004 (B, S9H, 99 d18, Ho1 oM ®T1 T §) 1094 & eRamm

P GRT 2 H— FRfrE 11 B
@) @ (i) & WM R, Ffalaa @vs uferenfia faar smom, sierfq— ;TzTﬁ;:{Tr

‘(i) AR W AN T, PIs AN, TR AT Afell AT Zigoivsy, R
3TERE a¥ @l Mg T X o B
@) @S (Ixx) & 915, FAfaRead @vs, @1 S, Jqid—
(Ixx—a) “aTe |¥T" A AU &, UJd I UGd & IS Harad—ad Bl
ATl AT H Uolipa JAfdadl 9 AddR a9+ a1 dig e | |
3. o AR B RT3 B IU-—GRT (1) & W W, FF=eRad SU—gRT UfoRenfua @1 1994 & gRamm
\—,‘quﬂ’agﬂ%[:_ srfarfm 11 @
‘(1) U—D UM U, UAgd Gk dr e ukyg, 99 9o 99 §Hd o fhd qmjﬁr
fafr & sl g faafea & & Srch 8, o1 row Mafes emarT gR1 oy @
TE siftrgee, R faifaa ufa~f sftsgfaa g o € @ fafy & dfg oy
PI 3ad & forg air eI |

4. A ARAFE B RT3 @ qre, FERad aRT I ST, srerfd— 1994 & R

" : ftrfes 11 #
3b. IS AHI—(1) IARBR B A QT B JAEfH, IAD IS THI BE AN o o oo <y

HFH9 H FH TP R IR BT | ST |

(2 & oS T & ST & foly Tofd, a1€ |91 & AR @ fed G Bl
TE 9T &9 A7 49 Aewdl, St W B B, HH T8 eF |

@) T W, W A, o fafza @1 Sy, d frefaRea wfedal w1 owan den
f=faRaa el &1 fdes sl srerfq—
(@) dTS |HT & &F | AN DI ST aTell AIS1e SR [IH BrRiwdl & U

IR AT 3R Rgar AuiRa &1 ik a4\ d=d faera areeT §
AT BRA B FoIU I UTH AT DI HOTT;

(@) TIa 9Hevs & JAER WR AR I A8l & ol aTs |1 & &
A | S U ARAT BT UgAM PRAT R IR B A H U
AR @7 R AR BRAT SR I T YA Bl WoTTT;

(M IR A A geR B ST FEREr o UeF AR ffe—dgrdn

YT R aTel el &l griar aediiid R

@) U UEd & SMEGIRAT S gRT 918 9HT 3l 6% & 91 BE AN Bl
IRt 3rafey # 1 S arelt Jareh iR fHhy I arel wanfad wrt &
IR H AT YT BT,

(®) < W9 & &3 | [t IW Uad & fRds URe Mo wRoamM
TeTId | A T AT




266 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ., (EXTRA.), FEB. 26, 2020 (PHGN. 7, 1941 SAKA)
@) ars |9 & FORIT IR BT S aTell STeddt dRdTs R U g=ad | AT
T AT,
®) fae o & fou WRed 5™ 3R The § qAT U dd 3ieH Suded
HRATT AT ATFI] HRAT AR Wfesd M & Argd | W [Jam st
BT TN FHRaTT,
@) I8 AT =1 & oY v &= & a1 991 & 9ew, I UAIa
DI BRI BT YA AR FON BT T A &
) TS [ D aF B |IOR Tl DI IR I AHRIIS ST T, ATdIi-Th
F3il, Adwe Wewar sasdl, A glawel ik W o Adwits
FE—Jfaen arasil & oy e g,
(31) IS W B &F | Ol AT SR Il YD Ja=E H HiAl DI g
HRAT TAT GIRIHAS SUTT FITT:
©) v Zd o 6 aesdT, JAiaRor EReTT 9T YuYT aRer & At
TR SIRTSEAT TS 6T,
@) US| B &gF ¥ Weodl YdwHE H UM UArd & HHATRAT Bl FERIr
FRAT IR F—BIDE Bl 5 H Weod Hal o,
€) I I ® &7 D W) Ue Rl & HRIGH Ga &,
@) dIS I & &F @ ¥IaR o W deal $I Al faey w9 3 dH
DI AHAT R IRAR BT R ASTHRT TAT Ui MMUSTRAT I I~
B dTell "IN BT b H HETIAT BT,
©) S I S &F § Ffdadl @ A g & 92 I 3R UHdT BT 9erdl
o iR i @fdadl @ ufodr @ sifvafdd ueM wve @ forg
AP Id Ioadl SR WAl BT AT BRAT, qAT
@ U o Al & UANT SRAT IR U I Fdl &1 deT HRAn, Sl
fafRd fey wd |
@) TS | ® AR BT AT 3R Haferd w1 &I ufshar VAT grft, o fafga
T Y |
G) fodr a9 I B UAG AR P AeTeTdT FAfId Ire AW © eF | fAaifed
I ARG b He R 3R IFd] SFUReIf #, ¥Ru= gRT 7 By S
Il U ARG B Al T e gRT Bl TG |
6) OTS |W & AMA H [ g8 & T H G Ahod IURT HaRIT & AAQH
@ 9gAd g1 TR by SIme | |
1994 & ol I a1 T 11 H—
mﬂ (i) Su-urr (7) & 91, fA=faRad Su—eRT & SIeEh, rerfa—
Y T 11 BT (7)) UTH |ET B B A SAfeder & forg Torgfd, U /| & Al BT U
e | geT 9 Al O A e, o ff B9 8, | 'Rl
(i) Su-urT 8 #H 3rd #, frHfeRad wes dem T S Sgd, sreifa—
afe T AEN fvf gfadged sRor & famr ifraer # SuRerd =€t g € ar
I ARG @1 JFURAfT & RUE TRBR I HI " |
1994 & ol AT @ arT 17 & I W), e arT gfarenfid &1 Seh, srerid—
siRaron . . . . ~
R 11 17 HdHed BT IJUTRYT IT IGEHIVL—(1) DI W I TAIT g9 Hhed DI IR
B URT 17 BT B @ fafd | 9 A9 @ afd & Hiar IuTaRd, Feifdd, gRafda ar kgg wR Al
iR | 2

U] VT Hhed, SHd SUTRYT, [, RIdT a1 IgadeoT & forg, VT I
TR B Gl B Hof G BT A el IR | FART BT |
(2 fe felt yM darE gRT SEa Y & ey, e W < I fafrE, e
WRBR B AFAIGT UM 8, B oIy Adbed UTRd fbar ST fufard €, dr Aoy
I UEd gRT UIRA &< 9 Yd Udd U™ 991 & S99 $9d goId SiR
JFARA & T AT S IR I IRBR DI IIFAGT B [ol¢ 9T ST |




HARYANA GOVT. GAZ., (EXTRA.), FEB. 26, 2020 (PHGN. 7, 1941 SAKA) 267

(@) frll daRIG &1 BIS N Hhed, RBHR & Jd IJAGT B (91, T A DI 3@
D AT & a1 fhdl I dad gRT SurRa, denferd, aRafkia sierar Igq
eI fHar ST |

(4) U™ YErgd Heed & UIRG B AT HeH WHR & IAIeH, dfe ruferd &,
P fafr ¥ N 79 Y A & Hidk s9P Ahed TR BRIAE] BT | |

7. S AR BT ORI 20 B [T-GRT (1) H- 1994 & ER@TOT
(i) o H faemm " R @& @ W, 7 g uforenfid fasar Siroem; qen WZO%W%
(i) FrfaRed ™ e SITQ, sferid— e |

"IRg UM A 4 a9 & SR frefed ari @ Rui R wwlt qen
HROT Y fAfARad T | |

8. T AMFH B URT 24 P IU-GRT (4) H, ‘TH TR “U' @I & WY W, “diF 1994 $ sRamom

R W ufoRenfid 5 e | srfafr 11 @1
YIRT 24 dT
e |

9. o AT T ORI 25 H - 1994 & ER@TOT

(i) s @) & wH R, Fr=faRaa @vs ufirenfya far Sgm, seriaq— W3 25?51[12'%
‘&) A ® IfAS BT Sl BT AT iR Uiy #R Adhdr &) e |

(i) s @) & 915, FrfaRad @vs S SN, AAid—
‘@) T § S wReT @ AT Al ey Jedr § &R At e @
oy Surr BR Fa g
@  MERT TR & yewE BT fAfafia w) ged
() g § Gol # ATANT BT YRV IR Fdeh 21" |
10. ol STETH B URT 27 B WM W, FEARIT aRT GfoRenfid @1 Sie, sierfd— 1994 & RN
"27. UM UAEd & HAT faRIY A1 AR oM< &I Sfasn & forg wiRka— @18 S 11 1

Ifqd, ST UTH UArId gRT SRT 24 T 25 & 9 IR fHY *1meer &) 1dsT $_ar ©, %;q—fﬂ
Al =gATH U Al ®UY, Sl AP &l A w/UY Tb derT Sff Fehdl ©, 3R A AT
=T Y&dT B, ar sifaRead wla, S U9 Ui e, s SR UM AT & gear W

7] YEdT B, @ folY U |l ©9 A% 9/ Off Al 8, & aiRd & fore gy g
R 3MMad! W @ fo enRa 9 g9k wUY @ o IR § 3 el gnf:

R B 3R b Al il @1 IR T 7 @1 @ & AR or T8l Prarg
STl €, A1 U8 Y—RIoRd & hT & WY H B8 A1 B WIAR ggal Dl gl ||

M. o ARAFE B g7 28 ¥, RS IR & WM W, ARE SUgdd” ¥ faRefud 1994 @ sRamm

fpu o | e 11 B
EINT 28 dT
SNICES

12. 9 ARAFEE & gRT 35 B IU-GRT (3) H, UEN S’ AR b W W, “UE Al 1094 B sRawn

T vreg gforenfid fy e | arfafr 11 @
EYINT 35 Pl
SNICES

13. T ARE BT gRT 43 B IT-GRT (2) H, ‘IAMIRA" W& & WM W, "UAK w1994 F RN

B e g fy g | s 11 @
EINT 43 T
e |

14. 9 AAFRIH BT GRT 54 DI IU—GRT (1) ¥, "= Al WO @I S WIHF W, “Th Bk 1994 & sRamm

T vreg gforenfid fey e | arfefras 11 @
EINT 54 T
e |

15. ¥l IMAFTIH @ gRT 125 H IU-GRT (4) ¥, "Uf9 A FWI" A&l & WH W, “Grg 1994 & RaArm

EOR W’ ¥ gferenfia fby S | o 11 @

CIN 125 @l

e |



268

HARYANA GOVT. GAZ., (EXTRA.), FEB. 26, 2020 (PHGN. 7, 1941 SAKA)

1994
R
e 11
BT GRT 171 BT
[N |
1994
R
arfarfrE 11
B YURT 172 BT
[N |
1994 &
R
arfarfTH 11
B IRT 176 BT
M |

1994 &
R
arfarfrE 11
B YRT 180 &I
e |
1994 &
R
srfarfH 11
B YURT 181 &I
A |
1994 &
R
srfarfTH 11
DT GRT 182 BT
M |
1994 &
R
arffrae 11
BT GRT 183 BT
e |
1994 &
R
arfarfT 11
B YURT 184 &I
M |
1994 &
gRarom
arfarfT 11
BT RT 185 BT
T |
1994 &
R
arffrae 11
B IRT 186 BT
e |
1994 &
R
arffrae 11
B YRT 187 &I
T |

1994 &
R
arfafH 11
DI GIRT 243 BT
AN |

16. o ARAFTH & 9R7 171 & WU (@) H TP TR SR AR] B W W, "Ud TR
SR Iee gfeRenfid fhy S |

17. o AT @ gRT 172 H IU-GRT (1) H, “dfF A FR” IAE] B @ R, "UE TR
TR g gfoRenfua fhg e |

12ﬁ§asﬁﬁ1ﬁwaﬁw176@%@—%(5)?%,%@%11@6@—%@@?@,
DI
“(6) SU—URT (4) & <N+ Rafde =marery gRT UIRA &< 9 =g o1 o,
W e B Ay 4 N T &Y el & DR, & F wrr AfRERar @ arer e
AT BT 3T B Fhall © | [Telm =raredier, oidied & gedrs @ 918, Qe Bl I,
gRafda s1erar Sore Adar & | e =armfrer &1 ok sifvas g |
19. ¥ STAFIH @1 gRT 180 &I IT—GRT (2) ¥, ‘TP FOIR HUY" V&I & WM W, U
TR ®Y” vreq wfeenfid farg e |

20. o AAFRH N URT 181 B SU-URT (2) H, TP TR IV’ T&l & ©E |, "dfF
BOIR BUY” Tsg gfaRenfid fy e |

21. o JAMAFRE B gRT 182 B IT—GRT (3) ¥, ‘TP FOR ®W’ &l & WM R, “UfF
TR ®U" TTeg gforenfid by S |

22, A JAMNRE B GRT 183 B SU—YRT (2) H, "l A HIY' Teql & @I W, U AR
wIY” T ufcrRenfid fhg S |

23. W AAIFTH B GRT 184 B IU-RT (3) H, ‘UH TR WYY Y&l B UM W, ‘“Ufh
FOR WV vreg wfoRenfd fhg Swe |

24, S JAMAFRE BT GRT 185 BT IT—GRT (1) ¥, “&T TAR [/IY” &I & W©F R, "UMF TR
I vre yfoRefid fy o |

25. W AW o 9”7 186 @Y IU-URT (1) H, "UfF A HIC AR B WE W, “UF TAR
wIY” Treg ufcRenfid fhg S |

26. ol ARTH BT GRT 187 B IU-GRT (2) H—
(i) @ (@) ¥ "Uh TR WIY V@I & WM R, ‘T TR w9y e gferenfid
fobq ST |
(i) wvs @) #, ‘dfg A U TG b WM W, “Ud gOR w9Y” I gfoenfud
%me
ol AR BT GRT 243 3, TP FOR HUY" @I & WM R, UG IR HIY" AR
qﬁwﬁﬁﬁmwﬁl



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ., (EXTRA.), FEB. 26, 2020 (PHGN. 7, 1941 SAKA) 269

IR T BRI BT faavor

1. T Jarad fIpRT TS BT IR B & oI ars F9T 9T UTH 9T BT 96d HRa] IaITD 8, ST
$HPT ISDI DI AT B & foIv BRH, Ufshar Tam 77 FeiRd &A1 a3 2 |

2. UEIIdl ]IS ARRIRI B 5 A1 @ BRIBIA BT ARF IAD] Yo 93 DI qold I FATd AN §RT SR
el e @1 [l | FRe - savas wHem T ©

3. UM AR & Rl @ sifvw Rerfr Jon \eaaar gREd a1 & foy a8 sravae || T b uM
A Y IR BT UIRG HR & 3 AN U S2 alus /G | B | g GHARead & 1 mawd
[ AT U GErd S9e IR R GHIdE dRId | dradral N |

4. il & Qi @1 wEwIfia den uReRiAT aF & forg 4f @1 9, Jee o deed & oy s T
TRBR B AFAGT & o0 AT | Yd U9 T9T & el RGT aTIdh FH 7 |

5. I UETgdl g ®8 o Tl & sifaRed @ o wfafaftat SRy smarT el get # wiw qaw,
B & ITARY ST AT STl WReAV BT AT UM v=gdl gRT AR qen yatid fear S savas
2| 39 SIfaRad I8 MMawads FHesh T &5 UM daradl & meel & fawy onfie o) gl I WWaR
B Forg T JEaTad R RId WeRT & FH9e Iu HRdl ol S |

6. SIIH & Pg UUMl & STEd P G H AT AR P IS ATIIS FH TAT Alfb IT§ FATEN
aR® & w9 4 B B TP |

7. oA H BRI GERR 16T AfRfIH, 1994 9RT 176 | UTET™ e € b gAg it H e <mrery
ERT UIRT JATQeT JAFTH BRI | ATl <11 §RT UIR JATQe & fa%wy 3dlel SRR 6+ b1 Al reen
el © | SAfIY I8 3Mawad A AT b FA1a ATt H fear <Irrery gRT uIkd afewr & fawee ardier
BT YI9eT HR fear o |

31t I fad o B
g&Id drera,
IU—=g 7,
R |
FUENTG : 3RO &0 igd,
el 26 WRERI, 2020. NilizER

8708—H.V.S.—H.G.P., Pkl.



